MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION

424 BLOUNT AVENUE

GUNTERSVILLE AL 35976

BID TABULATION FOR BID #25-25

CORRUGATED HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE PIPE & POLYPROPYLENE PIPE

BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM SEPTEMBER 2, 2025

POLYETHYLENE PIPE PRICE PER LINEAL FOOT

15"/ 18"/ 24"/ 30" / 36" / 42"/ 48" / COUPLING 60" / BELL &
VENDOR COUPLING EA. | COUPLING EA. COUPLING COUPLING EA. COUPLING EA. | COUPLING EA. EA. COUPLING EA. SPIGOT
CORE & MAIN, LP $8.21/$29.25 $11.09/$49.85 $18.19/$70.28 $25.86/$163.38 $31.62/$332.75 | $47.98/$405.06 | $52.73/$390.58 | $105.51/$607.58 Yes
MADISON, AL
FERGUSON WATERWORKS $10.05/$30.87 $13.75/$52.61 $23.90/$74.18 $32.28/$168.71 $43.25/$234.73 | $55.85/$336.26 | $70.40/$394.73 | $122.83/$607.58 Yes
PELHAM, AL
ADCO PIPE & SUPPLY LLC $8.83/$26.29 $11.92/$44.80 $19.57/$63.19 $27.83/$146.88 $34.02/$204.35 | $50.53/$299.11 | $56.74/$351.13 | $113.53/$546.20 Yes
FLORENCE, AL
FALLIN FARMS DBA HARVEY CULVERT [ $10.01/$25.00 $12.91/$40.00 $22.49/$60.00 $32.07/$120.00 $43.21/$200.00 | $55.00/$289.00 | $70.41/$335.00 | $118.90/$590.00 Yes
CLEVELAND, AL
SOUTHERN PIPE & SUPPLY $10.33 $15.07 $23.00 $32.00 $43.33 N/A $72.00 N/A Yes
ALBERTVILLE, AL
RAINBOW PIPE & METAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
RAINBOW CITY, AL
ADVANCED DRAINAGE SYSTEMS INC  [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BROWNBORO, AL
CAVCO INC. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BON AIR, AL
CONSOLIDATED PIPE & SUPPLY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
DECATUR, AL
CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS INC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HUNTSVILLE, AL
EAGLE WHOLESALE SUPPLY INC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ATHENS, AL
HUGHES SUPPLY INC. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MADISON, AL
CONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS LLC [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BIRCHWOOD, TN
BEAR CONCRETE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CULLMAN, AL
S & S WHOLESALE LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

RAINSVILLE, AL




HP PIPE

15"/ 18"/ 24"/ COUPLING 30" / 36" / 42" / 48" / COUPLING 60" / BELL &
VENDOR COUPLING EA. COUPLING EA. EA. COUPLING EA. COUPLING EA. COUPLING EA. EA. COUPLING EA. SPIGOT
CORE & MAIN, LP $16.17/$29.25 $20.60/$49.85 $34.72/$70.28 $55.87/$163.38 $59.19/$332.75 | $79.81/$405.06 | $104.62/$390.58 | $163.99/$607.58 Yes
MADISON, AL
FERGUSON WATERWORKS $17.55/$30.87 $22.38/$52.61 $37.70/$74.18 $58.70/$168.71 $64.28/$234.73 | $86.70/$336.26 | $113.65/$394.73 | $178.02/607.58 Yes
PELHAM, AL
ADCO PIPE & SUPPLY LLC $17.02/$29.11 $21.69/$49.61 $36.56/$69.95 $58.84/$162.62 $62.33/$294.61 | $84.05/$365.87 | $110.18/$409.05 | $172.71/$482.42 Yes
FLORENCE, AL MarMac MarMac MarMac MarMac
FALLIN FARMS DBA HARVEY CULVERT | $18.50/$25.40 $24.90/$43.00 $40.91/$61.00 $61.00/$152.00 $66.90/$212.50 | $90.30/$310.00 | $118.00/$360.00 | $190.00/$600.00 Yes
CLEVELAND, AL
SOUTHERN PIPE & SUPPLY $62.67 Yes
ALBERTVILLE, AL
RAINBOW PIPE & METAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
RAINBOW CITY, AL
ADVANCED DRAINAGE SYSTEMS INC  |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BROWNBORO, AL
CAVCO INC. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BON AIR, AL
CONSOLIDATED PIPE & SUPPLY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
DECATUR, AL
CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS INC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HUNTSVILLE, AL
EAGLE WHOLESALE SUPPLY INC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ATHENS, AL
HUGHES SUPPLY INC. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MADISON, AL
CONTECH ENGINEERED SOLUTIONS LLC [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BIRCHWOOD, TN
BEAR CONCRETE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CULLMAN, AL
S & S WHOLESALE LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

RAINSVILLE, AL
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